Meat, Grocery & Dry Goods
Opening Date: 7/23/14
Opening Time: 11:00AM
Bid Number: 1052-14

M&R SYSCO HPC THURSTON PERFORMANCE
APPROX. FOOD FOODSERVICE
ITEM NAME CASE PACK  ALT.BRAND/ SIZE / PACK MOS. USAGE VENDOR #
AVOCADO GUACAMOLE -CS 12/1#ICS 20090 $ 44.28 41.98] $ 50.89
36006 BACON-PRECOOK / Farmland or Tyson 300/CS 400 20100 $ 39.81 $55.33 34.02] $ 38.23
31012 BEEF-GROUND- 80/20 LB hummels 400 20251 $2.65] $ 2.82 $55.79 2.791#] $ 2.73
31010 BEEF-PATTY-80/20-4/# 40/4 0z/CS hummels 48/cs 12# 40 20330 $31.80] $ 28.08 $28.42 34.78] $ 32.78
55321 BEEF-PATTY-2.0 OZ. -CN (Maid-Rite Specialty Group) 192/2.50 0z/CS 3842 low sodium advanced 144/2.25 80 20360 $77.33] $ 83.53 $90.05 33.88] $ 26.70
TBD BEEF- SAND STEAKS / Advanced/Pierre 80/20z/6# BX maidrite 10# 75156-17000 37 20521 $33.40 NO BID 36.50] $ 42.91
TBD BEEF-PRECOOKED-Triple M LB low sodium thin and trim 600 20600 $6.09 NO BID 4.99/#] $ 4.74
17016 CALZONE - CHEESE CN 44/CS 70 20640 $37.101 $ 40.58 37.73] $ 39.88
TBD CHIX - PRECOOK-BREAST/BREADED / Tyson 40/ 40z /CS 703000 wh grain 120/4 oz 20 20760 $102.07] $ 41.71 $88.96 34.50] $ 36.88
CHIX - THIGH / BONELESS/ SKINLESS 4/10#/CS 20770 $ 66.14 $57.22 65.78] $ 66.19
22008 CHIX-NUGGET-#2378 CN / Tyson 250pc/CS 425 20810 $18.46] $ 18.49 $54.24 18.94] $ 19.64
TBD Grill Chix Brst. Filet, Tyson Red Label #31759 54/3.00z/CS 40 20850 $32.83] $ 42.46 $31.14 37.67]1 $ 48.47
23016 CHIX-PATTY-TERIYAKI CN / Pierre 90/30z/CS 20860 $39.13] $ 42.05 $38.95 39.26] $ -
23012 CHIX-STRIPS-TERIYAKI CN / Pierre 400/.750z/CS 2417 20870 $35.101 $ 40.36 $37.18 37471 $ -
22010 CHIX-PATTIE-#2379 CN / Tyson 60/3.530z/CS 140 20880 $21.20] $ 30.03 $53.56 20.88] $ 21.12
TBD CHIX-TENDERS-#5840 CN / Brakebush 145/1.10z/CS 350 20890 $36.75] $ 36.16 $52.69 25211 $ 27.67
CHIX-QUARTERS-IQF 60/8.50z/CS 21100 $ 58.73 $61.63 51.15] $ 51.29
CHIX-DRUMSTICKS-IQF 96/3.50z/CS 21110 $ 45.60 $34.45 50.94] $ -
25034 CHIX- DICED/ ALL WHITE/ 3/4 INCH 10# BOX 60 21200 $26.90] $ 42.45 $34.42 42.62] $ 27.38
EGG PLANT / CUTLET / BREADED 2/5#ICS 21630 $ 20.93 $20.62 22.49]1 $ 21.80
TBD FAJITAS-PRECKD CHIX 2/5#ICS goldkist 1330 30# 195 ct 75 21670 $101.38] $ 34.82 $23.47 24.64] $ 36.31
27022 FISH-SEA LEGS / Louis Kemp 12/2.5#ICS 21690 $3.97] $ 39.03 $12.31 17.50] $ 65.74
27014 FISH-POLLOCK FILET / K-8 53/3 0Z/CS 26373 viking 46/3.6 wh grain cn 21710 $25.05] $ 28.30 $42.18 22.49] $ 25.38
FISH-POLLOCK FILET / RAW 40/10#/CS 21730 NO BID 17.50] $ 98.25
29027 FRANKFURTER - 10# -ALL BEEF 10#/CS low sodium 160 21860 $24.86] $ 30.67 $24.63 21.108 $ 27.63
TBD FRANKFURTER - 10# -UNCURED CHICKEN 8/1 10#/CS 19455 kings delight antibiotic free $31.34 NO BID $ -
55180 FRENCH TOAST STIX / (Whole Grain) 5/2#/CS wh grain aunt jemima 180 21890 $13.73] $ 16.33 $17.89 16.15] $ 16.52
55387 FRZ SAUCE-ALFREDO 2/32 0z/CS jtm 6/5# red fat 262 servings 30 21900 $69.52] $ 19.86 $55.79 36.35] $ 22.44
FZN SAUCE-CRM PESTO 2/32 0Z/Cs 21920 $ 42.63 $28.16 34.151 $ 21.91
19022 LASAGNA -CN WG Tasty Brand 40/4 OZICS 110/4.3 wh grain tasty 12 21970 $70.171 $ 84.07 $78.92 77.701 $ 12.77
LASAGNA- MEAT 4/6#/CS 21980 $ 57.57 $75.43 61.52] $ 60.53
19023 LASAGNA-VEGETABLE 4/5.75#/CS 110/4.3 wh grain tasty 21990 $67.90] $ 49.19 $60.97 56.37] $ 56.49
35003 MEATBALLS-CKD/.50z ITAL. STYLE / Buon Gusto 320/.5 OZ/CS 50 22210 $14.20] $ 24.59 $25.96 $ 17.89
35002 MEATBALLS-CKD/ 1oz ITAL. STYLE / Buon Gusto 160/CS 100 22200 $14.20] $ 24.75 $25.96 $ 17.89
9016 PANCAKES-FROZEN / Mrs. Butterworth 144/CS wh grain aunt jemima 40 22350 $16.84] $ 19.73 $17.82 17.201 $ 14.61
39002 PEPPERONI / PRE-SLICED 25#/CS 5 22410 $21.90] $ 88.68 $30.32 56.75] $ 37.76




TBD CHEESE STICKS, STUFFED-Gilardi Self-Rising Bread Sticl4144/CS 20117 100 22420 $57.52] $ 44.24 $55.79 54.58] $ 42.94
POTATO & CHEESE FILLED PASTA, Mrs. T's - CN 400 pc./ CS Product Code: 41164-00833 NO BID 38.37] $ 44.49
18608 PIZZA | 4x6 | CN / The Maxx - MFG 12075 96/CS 12687 (new code) 220 22500 $45.521 $ 41.78 $45.27 33.36] $ 34.47
16022 PIZZA | SHELLS - 6"/51% WGR 72/CS 40 22575 $18.20] $ 33.85 19.43] $ 43.86
16028 PIZZA | SHELLS -14"/51% WGR 18/Cs 40 22590 $21.50] $ 43.58 23.92] $ 40.77
33022 PIZZA QUESADILLA - CN/ The Maxx 48/CS W/G 96COUNT 75 22600 $47.00] $ 31.75 $48.21 47.16] $ 48.72
34009 PORK / RIB-E-QUE CN/ Pierre 100/2.5 OZ/CS 44-531-0 advanced cn label 25 22605 $33.00] $ 40.25 $32.30 35.33] $ 31.96
19028 RAVIOLI/ CHEESE / CN - WG Tasty Brand 200/.80 OZ/CS 221/2.17 oz serving wg mini 22620 $71.79]1 $ 67.80 $62.73 74.20] $ 11.97
RAVIOLI / MEAT / Pede Bros. 200/.60 OZ/CS 22622 $ 22.64 15.16] $ 12.34
RAVIOLI/ SPINACH 2/3#/CS 22624 $ 31.66 19.60] $ 31.66
SAUSAGE/ITAL/MLD/10# 10#/CS 22630 $ 34.65 $24.63 30.25] $ 32.87
32020 SAUSAGE LNKS/TURKEY / Jones Dairy 239/.670z/CS 150 22640 $24.15]0 $ 31.53 $30.84 30.18] $ 23.67
32012 SAUSAGE PATTIE/ 8/#/PC LITE / Jones 10#/CS 35 22680 $24.00] $ 40.27 25.45] $ 25.91
SOUP / BROCCOLI W/CHEESE / Campbells 3/4#ICS 22700 $ 33.82 $33.69 32.86] $ 32.34
SOUP / CHICKEN DUMPLING / Campbells 3/4#ICASE 22730 $ 39.11 $38.68 37.79] $ 42.80
SOUP / CHICKEN NOODLE / Campbells 3/4#/CS 50 22740 $ 33.76 $34.70 26.37] $ 27.53
SOUP / CHILI CON CARNE / Campbells 3/4#/CS 3-5 22750 $ 31.18 $33.63 35.69] $ 52.75
SOUP / CLAM CHOW / MANHAT / Campbells 3/4#/CS 3-5 22780 $ 36.43 $36.06 39.34] $ 38.21
SOUP /N E CLAM CHOWDER / Campbells 3/4#/CS 3-5 22790 $ 37.45 $37.29 37.68] $ 42.60
SOUP / CR. OF ASPARAGUS / Campbells 3/4#/CS 3-5 22810 $ 38.85 $33.76 41.96] $ 41.24
SOUP / CR OF BROCCOLI/ Campbells 3/4#/CS 3-5 22820 $ 33.84 $38.84 34.10] $ 36.18
SOUP / CREAM OF MUSHROOM / Campbells 3/4#/CS 3-5 22840 $ 43.17 40.74]1 $ 17.01
SOUP / CR OF POTATO / Campbells 3/4#/CS 3-5 22850 $ 26.42 $27.22 28.75] $ 33.91
SOUP / FRENCH ONION / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22880 $ 34.42 $35.24 34.50] $ 36.76
SOUP / GUMBO SAUSAGE / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22885 $ 35.23 $35.08 35.44] $ 37.60
SOUP / ITALIAN WEDDING / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22890 $ 35.72 $35.59 35.95] $ 39.15
SOUP / MINESTRONE / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22900 $ 32.17 $32.05 32.250 $ 34.51
SOUP / PASTA FAGIOLI / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22910 $ 34.14 $33.79 34.00] $ 36.38
SOUP / SPLIT PEA W/HAM / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22920 $ 33.75 $33.63 33.97] $ 37.38
SOUP / TOM.GARD.VEG. / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22940 $ - $29.18 28.38] $ 30.47
SOUP / TOM.TORTELLIN / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22945 $ 36.84 37.72] $ 39.23
SOUP / VEGETABLE / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22950 $ 32.85 $31.51 33.11] $ 33.77
SOUP / VEGETABLE BEEF / Campbells 3/4#ICS 3-5 22960 $ 34.65 33.87] $ 37.19
19024 STUFFED SHELLS / CN / WG Tasty Brand 96/20z/CS 10 23000 $75.49]1 $ 89.83 $83.21 84.90] $ 20.05
TORTELLINI/ CHEESE 10#/CS 50 23050 $ 26.46 $19.67 20.13] $ 16.15
31014 TURKEY / GROUND 2/10#/CS butterball 90 23130 $28.90] $ 16.21 $22.74 44521 $ 27.05
FROZEN VEGETABLES
45030 BEANS / GREEN / CUT 12/2.5#ICS 23-Dec 20-25 30120 $16.45] $ 21.33 $18.18 19.750 $ 11.81
BLUEBERRIES / FROZEN 30#/CS 30200 $ 57.05 $60.83 39.61] $ 48.34
45054 BROCCOLI/ FLORETS 12/2#ICS 40 30250 $19.20] $ 15.08 $24.81 29.14] $ 18.72
45012 CARROTS / SLICED 12/2#ICS 20 30410 $14.28] $ 17.07 $18.07 19.99] $ 10.02
45060 CAULIFLOWER 12/2#ICS 10 30450 $17.30] $ 16.62 $23.89 2591] $ 28.43




45028 CORN / COBETTES 96/CS 20 30500 $13.70] $ 26.49 $20.54 13.98] $ 19.02
45026 CORN / WHOLE KERNEL 12/2.5#/ICS 50 30580 $22.05] $ 27.74 $24.22 26.68] $ 14.55
EDAMAME 6/2.5#/CS 10 30590 $ 39.18 $29.67 28.50] $ 29.09
GRILLED PEPPERS & ONIONS 6/2.5#/CS 15 30630 $ 32.61 $35.38 30.22] $ 31.16
45016 MIXED VEG / CALIFORNIA 12/2#/CS 30670 $19.90] $ 2251 21.62] $ 14.07
45020 PEAS / GREEN 12/2.5#/ICS 30800 $23.12] $ 29.00 $29.00 31.72] $ 15.66
45038 PEAS & CARROTS 12/2.5#/ICS 30850 $21.95] $ 22.16 $27.78 29.37] $ 19.41
44076 POTATO / SMILES FRIES 6/4#/ICS 30 30940 $22.471 $ 22.16 $21.54 22.14] $ 21.98
TBD POTATO/Fries-Quick Oven, Clear Coat, Shoestring /Cavend6/5#/CS mcf03789 350 30980 $22.30] $ 22.23 $20.59 23.25]1 $ 26.89
55190 POT. / SWEET POT FRIES-Krinkle Cut / McCain 6/2.5#/CS 25 30990 $20.17] $ 20.10 $19.42 19.451 $ 19.05
TBD POTATO / TRIANGLES - Orida/McCain 6/5#/ICS 0if0049a 150 31000 $23.63 NO BID $22.48 22.23] $ 19.36
55184 POTATO / WEDGE / SEASONED 6/5#/CS mcx03626 12 31010 $21.89] $ 29.69 $20.59 21.01] $ 29.62
45036 SPINACH / CHOPPED 12/3#/CS 31060 $31.62] $ 18.82 $27.63 29.60] $ 39.07
45063 SQUASH/ BUTTERNUT 20#/CS 31070 $16.90] $ 47.73 $40.67 39.95] $ 22.78
DAIRY / CHEESE/ JUICE
42004 CHEESE / AMERICAN YEL / BLOCK 6/5#/CS 2.60 per pound 25 40140 $78.00 NO BID 77.25) $ -
CHEESE / AMERICAN YEL / BLOCK (LOW-FAT) 6/5#/CS 25 $ 41.64 $ -
42008 CHEESE / AMER / SLICED .5 oz 4/5#ICS 2.345 per pound 100 40160 $46.90] $ 48.35 $35.20 46.00mkt] $ 49.42
CHEESE / AMER / SLICED / LOW-FAT .5 oz $ 85.14 67.89] $ -
CHEESE / CHEDDAR / BLK LB 300 40170 $ 27.07 $40.00 2.721#] $ 2.69
42032 CHEESE / CHEDDAR / SHREDDED 4/5#ICS 2.95# 40180 $59.00] $ 67.92 $59.91 51.30mkt] $ 51.97
42024 CHEESE / MOZZ. /| BLOCK (Part-Skim) LB 300 40200 $2.60] $ 2.36 2.571#] $ 2.23
42022 CHEESE / MOZZ /| SHREDDED (Part-Skim) 4/5#/CS 6/5# 40210 $79.00] $ 53.21 59.62 mkt] $ 76.04
CHEESE / PAR & ROM GRAT 12/1#ICS 12 40230 $ 26.44 $43.56 41.75] $ 18.33
42020 CHEESE / SWISS / 12# LB 220 40250 $3.25] $ 3.51 $4.04 3.78/#] $ 3.66
42040 CHEESE / PROVOLONE # LB 450 40260 $2.98] $ 2.63 $3.49 2.63/# mkt] $ 2.54
CRM CHEESE / PKS / Philly 100/CS light aloutte 110 40310 $16.50] $ 20.88 $20.27 20.22] $ 20.60
EGGS /WHITES / LIQ 6/5#/CS 40560 $ 52.85 $49.26 52.04] $ 51.69
11054 FRUIT JUICE / APPLE / Sun Cup 70/4 OZICS 200 41020 $7.45] $ 8.69 $9.09 7.40 $ 10.65
11060 FRUIT JUICE / ORAN/PINEAPPLE / Sun Cup 70/4 OZICS 80 41140 $8.60 NO BID $10.31 9.31]1 $ 11.95
11050 FRUIT JUICE / APPLE/CRANBERRY / Sun Cup 70/4 OZICS 120 41150 $8.05 NO BID $8.56 8.72] $ 11.95
11058 FRUIT JUICE / PINEAPPLE / Sun Cup 70/4 OZICS 75 41160 $7.90] $ 12.12 $9.54 9.09] $ 9.68
11052 FRUIT JUICE / ORANGE / Sun Cup 70/4 OZICS 165 41170 $8.45] $ 10.24 $11.06 8.49] $ 11.91
42070 STRING CHEESE 48/CS 40 42240 $10.60] $ 43.54 $37.20 35.201 $ 20.82
5070 YOGURT / DANIMALS / STRAWBERRY 48/4 OZICS upstate long shelf life 50 42950 $11.78] $ 11.60 $10.86 11.291 $ 10.98
5072 YOGURT / DANIMALS / STRAW-BAN 48/4 OZICS upstate long shelf life 50 42990 $11.78] $ 11.60 $10.86 11.291 $ 13.70
YOGURT / MIX / FROZEN / VANILLA 2/2 GAL/CS 78001 $ 35.73 $38.85 88.15] $ 37.22
YOUGRT / MIX / FROZEN / CHOCOLATE 2/2 GAL/CS 78002 $ 35.73 $38.85 88.15] $ 37.22
BAKED GOODS / FROZEN
7411 BAGEL / FZN / WHITE WHOLE GRAIN/ Lenders 72/20Z./CS 074 lender 150 70050 $14.50] $ 15.82 $15.21 15.44] $ 18.52




5045 BISCUITS / 2.25 02 100/2.25/CS 232924 advanced 70150 $13.56] $ 33.20 $25.58 27.53] $ 30.52
TBD PAR BAKED / DINNER ROLL 240/1.50z/CS 120/1.5 artisan roll 70500 $18.14]1 $ 30.19 $42.73 26.26] $ 39.74
PAR BAKED / PETIT PAINS 16/1.50z/CASE 70510 $ 36.48 32.89] $ 41.89
PAR BAKED / FRENCH BREAD 180/CS 70530 $ 38.80 34.92] $ 29.24
15060 COOKIES / Sweet Discovery - Asst / Otis Spunkmeyer 240/1.33 0z/CS $43.06] $ 44.02 53.32] $ 48.17
14060-1409 COOKIES / Red Fat / ASST. / Otis Spunkmeyer 240/1.33 0z/CS 1.5 oz wh grain $34.05] $ 44.02 $42.63 42.97] $ -
15010-150)COOKIES / Red Fat / ASST. / Otis Spunkmeyer 320/1.0 0z/CS 384/1 oz red fat $26.81] $ 46.97 $45.48 46.02] $ -
8007 CROISSANTS / SLICED 144/2.20z/ICS wh grain 15 70730 $37.56] $ 36.12 36.13] $ 24.80
8007 CROISSANTS / SLICED - WGR 144/2.20z/ICS wh grain 15 70730 $37.56] $ 42.58 $23.20 37.52] $ -
DANISH / MINI / VARIETY 50/1.25/CS 70790 $ 40.29 $48.08 20.78] $ 21.59
DOUGH ROLL CINN. LOAF / Karps 60/4 OZ/CS 50 70840 $ 33.96 34.74] $ 37.41
TBD ENGLISH MUFFIN / THOMAS 6 DZ/CS homestead 144/cs 70860 $15.201 $ 17.98 $19.37 17.401 $ 20.86
TBD GYRO / FLAT BREAD / ROUND / 7" kontons 11070 72/cs $14.15]1 $ 29.52 $55.04 28.00] $ 52.53
MUFF BAT / BANANA / Karps 16# TUB 71000 $ 47.85 46.85] $ 19.88
MUFF BAT / BLUE BERRY / Karps 18# TUB 25 71010 $ 42.37 $49.18 46.68] $ 42.14
MUFF BAT / CAPPUCINO / Karps 18# TUB 71011 NO BID 35.24] $ 41.11
MUFF BAT / CHIP O PLENTY / Karps 18# TUB 300 71012 $ 37.75 $38.29 38.34] $ 39.05
MUFF BAT / CINN. / COFFEE / Karps 18# TUB 60 71015 $ 39.02 $40.20 38.00] $ 39.58
MUFF BAT / CORN / Karps 18# TUB 25 71020 $ 39.97 $36.22 37.55]1 $ 39.13
MUFF BAT / CRAN-NUT / Karps 18# TUB 71030 $ 43.44 $40.64 44.16] $ 49.36
MUFF BAT / SOUR CR & POPPY / Karps 18# TUB 71045 $ 38.66 41.77] $ 41.31
MUFF BAT / RAISIN BRAN / Karps 18# TUB 71050 $ 39.30 $38.41 41.77] $ 40.27
PIE SHELLS / DEEP DISH 20/Cs 71065 $ 24.87 $19.79 25.09] $ 24.60
4060 PRETZELS / SOFT / FRZ/ WGR / New York Pretzel 100/2.50z/CS 30110 wh grain 85 71080 $19.80] $ 23.24 $22.63 2290 $ 26.49
47007 TORTILLA / WHOLE GRIAN RICH / 6" (Mission) 12/12/CS 288/cs tyson wh grain 50 71620 $24.36] $ 26.03 $24.62 28.401 $ -
55035 TORTILLA / WHOLE GRAIN RICH / 8" (Mission) 12/12/CS 9" low soduim 144/cs 71630 $20.70] $ 36.09 $17.16 38.25] $ 35.07
55036 TORTILLA / WHOLE GRAIN RICH /10" (Mission) 12/12/CS solis $23.68] $ 27.05 $18.56 29.30] $ -
TBD TORTILLA / FLOUR/ 6"/ Tyson 24/12/CS 22259 low soduim 288/ 71670 $24.36] $ 20.09 15.49] $ 18.73
47051 TORTILLA / FLOUR/ 10"/ Tyson 16/12/CS 9" low sodium 288/cs 71700 $20.70] $ 26.56 21.13] $ 13.44
47040 TORTILLA / FLOUR/ 12"/ Tyson 6/12/CS 60/ct solis 120 71600 $10.76] $ 15.76 $20.58 14.03] $ 16.05
DRY GOODS
APPLESAUCE /FANCY 6/#10/CS 50100 25.09 $24.21 19.12] $ 26.45
APPLES / SLICED / FA 6/#10/CS 50150 46.50 $50.04 42.20] $ 31.56
ARTICHOKE HEARTS/MARINATED 6/3 KG/CS 50160 $ 56.67 $51.05 53.16] $ 52.81
BAKER'S COCOA 5# BAG 50190 NO BID $21.09 14.32] $ 27.49
BAKING POWDER 5# CTR 50201 $ 56.93 $10.31 14.20] $ 13.55
BAKING SODA / 12/2# 12/2#ICS 50250 $ 16.13 $16.74 16.70] $ 17.25
TBD BEANS / BLACK/CS 6/#10/CS 50620 $22.701 $ 21.24 $24.29 23.701 $ 23.52
BEAN SALAD/THREE/CS 6/#10/CS 50630 $ 32.83 $28.96 26.60] $ 32.72
BEANS / PINTO (WHITE) / CS 6/#10/CS 50640 $ 21.74 $21.00 17.83] $ 23.79
TBD BEANS / KIDNEY/ CS 6/#10/CS 50650 $25.50] $ 23.22 $25.61 26.50] $ 23.84
BEANS/VEG/CS 6/#10/CS 50670 $ 29.91 $21.42 22.35] $ 33.10




BEETS/VEG/CS 6/#10/CS 50700 $ 27.26 $19.75 17.99] $ 24.18
CAKE MIX / BROWNIE / non complete, CM 6/5#/CS 50780 NO BID $42.00 25.60] $ 27.75
CAKE MIX / DEV FOOD /non complete, CM 6/5#/CS 50790 $ 26.95 $41.84 25.441 $ 27.57
CAKE MIX / YELLOW / non complete, CM 6/5# CS 50795 $ 23.70 $34.41 22.49]1 $ 24.38
CEREAL / BOWL / BERRY KIX 96 EA/CS 15 51130 $ 26.54 $26.49 25791 $ 28.38
TBD CEREAL / BOWL / HON CHER 96 EA/CS 15 51140 $20.90] $ 26.54 $26.49 25791 $ 28.04
CEREAL / BOWL / CHEERIOS 96 EA/CS 15 51150 $ 26.54 $26.49 25.79]1 $ 28.04
CEREAL / BOWL / CORN POPS 96 EA/CS 15 51160 NO BID 19.92]1 $ 32.36
CEREAL / BOWL/COCOA KRIS 96/EAICS 15 51170 $ 20.38 $22.48 25.79] $ -
TBD CEREAL / BOWL/ CORN FLAKE 96 EA/CS 15 51210 $20.90] $ 20.38 $22.48 19.92] $ 32.36
TBD CEREAL / BOWL / RAIS BRAN 96 EA/CS 15 51240 $ 20.38 $22.48 19.92] $ 32.36
CEREAL / BOWL / SPECIAL K 96 EA/CS 15 51260 $ 20.40 $22.48 19.92] $ 32.36
CEREAL / BOWL / RICE KRIPY 96 EA/CS 15 51270 $ 20.38 $22.48 19.92] $ 19.94
CEREAL /BOWL / S FRST FLAK 96 EA/CS 15 51280 $ 20.38 $22.48 19.92] $ 19.94
CEREAL / BOWL / TOTAL 96 EA/CS 15 51300 NO BID disc] $ -
CEREAL / BOWL / WHEATIES 96 EA/CS 15 51320 $ 34.62 disc] $ -
CEREAL / BULK / RICE KRISPIE 4BAGS/CS 40 51330 $ 20.76 $14.79 17.86] $ 24.10
TBD CEREAL/APP JACK REDU-SUGAR 96 EA/CS 51360 $20.90] $ 20.38 $20.92 19.92] $ 31.67
CERAL/COCO PUFF REDU-SUGAR 96 EA/CS 51370 $ 26.54 $26.49 25791 $ -
CEREAL/FRUIT LOOP REDU-SUGAR 96 EA/CS 51380 $ 20.38 $22.48 19.92] $ -
51018 CHEESE SAUCE MIX 8/30 OZ/CS 51420 $52.00] $ 61.95 50.34] $ 65.76
TBD CHILI QUICK START MIX 12/16.50z/CS santigo 51450 $32.68] $ 34.30 $28.99 31.62] $ 32.80
CHINESE NOODLES / CH MEIN 6/#10/CS 51500 $ 29.82 25.89] $ 24.63
CHIPS / BULK / POTATO 6/1#/CS 51570 $ 14.05 $12.72 12.78] $ 13.06
CHIPS / BULK / PITA 6/18 OZ/CS 51610 $ 26.38 $ 25.02
47004 CHIPS / BLK / TORTILLA / WW 2/3#ICS 80 51650 $8.80] $ 11.52 $12.20 22508 $ 12.18
CHOC. CHIPS / MINI / HERSH 25#/CS 51660 $ 64.49 $62.23 66.58] $ 40.32
TBD CHICK PEAS/CS 6/#10/CS 52020 $22.70] $ 21.49 $20.58 20.68] $ 23.74
CORN STARCH 24/#1/CS 52100 $ 18.20 $17.61 17551 $ 18.70
Couscous/Cs 6/36 OZ/CS 52170 $ 20.33 $30.71 30.50] $ 19.91
CRAISINS / BULK 2/48 0z/CS 74710 $ 15.08 $14.11 14.07] $ 14.26
CRANBERRY SAUCE/ JEL/CS 6/#10/CS 52200 $ 38.87 $37.14 30.87] $ 39.72
CROUTONS / SEASONED - WGR 4/2.25#ICS 52250 $ 39.90 $22.93 27.208 $ 17.67
DRESSING / BALSAMIC VINAIGRETTE 4/1 GAL/CS 52540 $ 32.52 $38.14 35421 $ 35.87
DRESSING / BLUE CHEESE / Cains 4/ 1 GAL/CS 52550 $ 51.68 $51.35 47.50] $ 56.52
DRESSING / CREAMY CEASAR / Ken's 4/ 1 GAL/CS 52560 $ 50.51 $44.56 4491] $ 46.01
DRESSING / RANCH / Hidden Valley 4/1 GAL/CS 52570 $ 44.23 $33.69 51.88] $ 47.89
DRESSING MIX/ ITALIAN / Good Seasons 12/6 OZICS 52580 $ 48.90 $40.98 41.30] $ 34.68
DRESSING / HONEY MUSTARD 4/ 1 GAL/CS 52590 $ 41.28 $38.62 4471 $ 39.40
DRESSING MIX / RANCH / Hidden Valley 18 PKG/CS 52600 $ 33.20 $31.45 32.09] $ 27.51
DRESSING / 1000 ISLAND / Ken's 4/1 GAL/CS 52610 $ 39.27 $36.84 39.60] $ 36.85
EXTRACT / VANILLA / IMITAT QT 52741 $ 62.14 $4.06 1.95] $ 9.43
FLOUR / ALL PURPOSE 2/25#/BAGS 53000 $ 17.27 $17.76 19.35] $ 16.99
FROST. MIX/ CREAMY FUDGE 2/11#ICS 53180 $ 63.73 $60.14 59.95] $ 64.66




FROST. MIX/ CREAMY WHITE 2/11#ICS 53190 $ 59.70 $55.99 55.74] $ 60.16
FRUIT COCKTAIL / LIGHT SYRP 6/#10/CS 53200 $ 37.33 $42.23 39.50] $ 36.12
GELATIN / BLUEBERRY 12/24 OZICS 53290 NO BID 27.66] $ -
GELATIN / CHERRY 12/24 0zICS 53300 NO BID $27.98 24.54]1 $ 27.11
GELATIN / LEMON 12/24 0zICS 53350 NO BID $27.98 24.54]1 $ 27.11
GELATIN / LIME 12/24 0zICS 53400 NO BID $27.98 24.54]1 $ 27.11
GELATIN / STRAWBERRY 12/24 0zICS 53500 NO BID $27.98 24.54]1 $ 27.11
GINGERALE 12/LTRICS 53570 $ 10.55 $9.74 8.80] $ 8.77
GRAVY / BROWN / LE GOUT (low sodium) 12/5#ICS 53590 NO BID 30.80] $ 35.81
GRAVY / TURKEY / LE GOUT (low sodium) 12/#5/CS 53600 NO BID 35.55) $ 46.34
HONEY / 5# JUG 5#JUG 53701 NO BID $15.97 16.10] $ 16.76
JALAPENOS / SLICED 6/#10/CS 53900 $ 26.91 $20.36 27.92]1 $ 29.39
JELLY / GRAPE 6/#10/CS 54000 $ 66.11 $58.67 46.35] $ 52.13
JIMMIES / RAINBOW 10#/CS 54100 $ 12.71 $49.56 14.82] $ 16.59
JIMMIES / CHOCOLATE 10#/CS 54120 $ 12.71 $14.21 15.30] $ 16.59
JIMMIES / DARK GREEN 10#/CS 54130 NO BID 16.11] $ 17.16
KETCHUP/TOMATO/HEINZ 6/#10/CS 54210 $ 30.69 $18.60 19.05] $ 19.21
LEMON JUICE / PLASTIC BOTTLE 12/QTI/CS 54300 $ 23.65 $16.38 19.75] $ 27.26
LIME JUICE / PLASTIC BOTTLE 12/33.8 OZ/CS 54310 $ 21.04 $40.66 40.89] $ 12.11
MACARONI/ BOWTIES 2/10#/CS whole grain 54490 $ 22.33 $31.64 10.89] $ 16.79
51040 MACARONI / ELBOWS 2/10#/CS whole grain 40 54500 $15.60] $ 18.00 $15.82 16.24] $ 14.06
51059 MACARONI / BARILLA / PENNE /WW 2/10#/CS 54520 $16.90] $ 23.06 $16.58 16.22] $ 22.93
MACARONI / FETTUCINI 2/10#/CS 54530 $ 20.09 $15.82 16.24] $ 16.51
MACARONI / SHELL / MEDIUM 20#/CS 54550 $ 20.90 $15.82 16.24] $ 16.01
MACARONI / SPAGHETTI 20/1#ICS whole grain 40 54600 $15.60] $ 14.77 $15.82 16.24] $ 14.06
51050 MACARONI /PENNE 2/10#/CS whole grain 40 54620 $15.60] $ 14.77 $15.82 16.24] $ 16.86
MACARONI/ TRI-COLOR / ROTINI 10#/CS 54640 $ 24.11 $11.11 12.03] $ 21.71
MANDARIN ORANGES 6/#10/CS 54840 $ 28.67 $30.53 27.60] $ 23.60
MAYONNAISE/HELLMAN'S 4/GAL/ICS 30 54850 $ 56.78 $56.44 58.84] $ 59.82
MARSHMELLOS / MINI 12/1#/CS 35 54870 $ 20.79 $19.81 15.76] $ 15.30
MILK / DRY / NONFAT 6/5#/CS 54880 $ 10121 $104.85 140.90] $ 131.19
MUSTARD / DELI STYLE 4/GAL/CS 54960 $ 18.79 $28.92 13.79] $ 23.13
NOODLES / EGG / MEDIUM 2/5#ICS 55000 $ 13.51 $10.04 11.991 $ 12.34
NUTRI GRAIN BAR/ APPLE 48/1.3 OZ/CS 12 55015 $ 20.56 $19.14 19.82] $ 22.51
NUTRI GRAIN BAR/ BLUEBERRY 48/1.3 OZ/CS 35 55011 $ 20.56 $19.14 19.82] $ 29.41
NUTRI GRAIN BAR/ RASPBERRY 48/1.3 OZ/CS 25 55013 $ 20.56 $19.14 19.82] $ 23.14
NUTRI GRAIN BAR/ STRAWBERRY 48/1.3 OZ/CS 30 55010 $ 20.56 $19.14 19.82] $ 29.13
CHEWEY GRANOLA BARS / Quaker 120/Cs 35 55017 $ 27.18 $26.13 24550 $ 27.03
OATMEAL / INST/PLAIN / Quaker 4/16 1 OZ/ICS 50 55020 $ 10.35 $9.01 9.16] $ 9.78
OATMEAL / INST. VAR. / Quaker 48/1 0Z/CS 55030 $ 17.36 $33.01 17.56] $ 17.26
OATS / ROLLED 12/42 OZICS 55040 $ 29.75 $34.81 30.50 $ 30.20
OLIVES / BLACK / SLICED 6/10#//CS 55050 $ 32.66 $25.26 27.92] $ 30.60
ONIONS / CHOPPED / DRIED 6/3#/CS 55100 $ 67.57 $58.74 62.57] $ 12.93
48026 PACKS /BBQ SAUCE / HEINZ 200/Cs four and one 55160 $5.28] $ 13.28 $6.93 11.750 $ 7.46




48016 PACKS / DRSG / ITALIAN 200/CS four and one 55210 $4.79] $ 15.71 $6.48 5.94]1 $ 6.85
48018 PACKS / DRSG / FRENCH 200/.50z/CS four and one 55250 $5.65] $ 16.87 $7.68 7.100 $ 7.04
PACKS/ BALSAMIC VINEGARETTE / Ken's 60/1.5/CS 10 55255 $ 10.87 $9.73 9.92]1 $ 10.04
PACKS / DRSG / HONEY-MUSTARD / Ken's 60/1.5/CS 10 55260 $ 12.26 $10.20 10.41] $ 9.80
PACKS / DRSG / CRMY ITALIAN / Ken's 60/1.5/CS 10 55290 $ 10.32 $9.23 9421 $ 9.53
PACKS / DRSG / ITALIAN-FF / Ken's 60/1.5/CS 10 55310 $ 7.81 $6.99 7.13]1$ 7.22
PACKS / DRSG / CAESAR / Ken's 60/1.5/CS 10 55315 $ 12.53 12.03] $ 11.58
PACKS / DRSG / RNCH / L-CAL / Ken's 60/1.5/CS 10 55320 $ 14.34 $9.89 10.10] $ 9.33
PACKS / DRSG / 1000 ISLAND / Ken's 60/1.5 OZ/CS 10 55330 $ 10.59 $9.47 $ 9.78
48050 PACKS / JELLY / ASSORTED 200/Cs 55345 $7.59] $ 13.49 $10.22 6.73] $ 9.46
48032 PACKS / HONEY CSs 200/.9gm 55350 $15.00] $ 27.31 $14.76 19.47] $ 20.87
PACKS / KETCHUP / HEINZ 1000 EA/CS 40 55380 $ 28.85 $14.21 13.49] $ 14.67
PACKS / MAYONNAISE / HIEIN 200 EA/CS 60 55420 $ 17.81 $12.11 12.35] $ 12.23
PACKS / MUST / GULDENS 500 EA/CS 25 55470 $ 20.30 $18.95 18.45] $ 18.87
PACKS / MUST / YEL / HEINZ 500 EA/CS 25 55480 $ 13.66 $9.21 9.40] $ 10.79
PACKS / PEPPER 3000/CS 55550 $ 29.89 $10.14 8.43] $ 20.33
PACKS / RELISH / HEINZ 200 EA/CS 55570 $ 27.53 $8.42 8.95] $ 7.01
PACKS / SUGAR / 2000 2000 EA/CS 55650 $ 10.95 $11.12 10.85] $ 11.98
PACKS / SALT 3/1000/CS 55660 $ 11.13 $4.52 5.07] $ 9.45
PACKS / SPLENDA 2000/Cs 55680 $ 26.99 $30.08 27.60] $ 25.49
PACKS / EQUAL 2000/Cs 55690 $ 25.29 $27.60 27.60] $ 19.94
PACKS / SOY SAUCE 500/CS 55710 $ 7.64 12,191 $ 7.38
PACKS / SYRUP / HEINZ 100/1 .5 Oz/CS 200 55730 $ 15.31 $8.41 15.70] $ 6.49
48030 PACKS / TACO SAUCE 200 EA/CS 200/.9 55750 $5.05 NO BID $22.29 479 $ 6.73
48012 PACKS / TARTAR SAUCE 200/Cs 500/ 55760 $12.701 $ 15.66 $7.41 8.15] $ 8.00
PANCAKE BATTER/Aunt Jemima (Complete) 6/5#/CS 55790 $ 26.97 $27.53 28.69] $ 26.71
51078 PAN COATING - Vegalene, Butter & Plain, Allergen Free 6/17 0z/CS butter others below 55800 $21.22 NO BID $24.74 26.30] $ 14.32
PEACHES / DICED / JUICE PACKED 6/#10/CS 30 55850 $ 33.80 $39.53 38.45] $ 30.07
PEANUT BUTTER/CRMY-NO TRAN FAT 6/5# TUB/CS 56000 $ 56.52 $66.80 56.95] $ 53.21
PEARS / DICED / JUICE PACKED 6/#10/CS 30 56030 $ 32.22 $37.62 36.10] $ 30.91
PEPPERS / ROASTED RED 6/#10/CS 56040 $ 3341 $34.29 33.96] $ 33.97
PEPPERS / CHIPOTLE WHOLE IN ADOBE 6/#10/CS $ 32.83 55.01] $ 36.99
PICKLES / KOSHER SPEARS 6/#10/CS 56260 $ 35.23 $27.11 28.201 $ 26.82
PIE FILLING / LEMON 6/#10/CS 56300 $ 37.23 $31.14 32.75] $ -
PINEAPPLE JUICE 12/46 0zICS 56390 $ 25.67 $21.32 27.09] $ 28.53
PINEAPPLE / TIDBITS 6/#10/CS 25 56400 $ 30.77 $23.16 23.34] $ 24.83
TBD PIZZA SAUCE - ANGELA MIA (no salt Marinara) 6/#10/CS angela mia 42203 150 56450 $31.11 NO BID $22.90 29.84] $ 21.58
55211 POTATO PEARLS 6/3.5#/CS idahian 56500 $39.30] $ 49.36 $50.04 42.75] $ 49.64
POTATOES / WHOLE 6/#10/CS 56510 NO BID $29.63 28.24]1 $ 35.32
POTATO / SWEET / WHOLE 6/#10/CS 56520 $ 35.40 $41.18 32911 $ 26.45
PUNCH / FRUIT CONCEN 8:1 4/GAL/ICS 56970 $ 21.45 29.72] $ -
PUMPKIN 6/#10/CS 57000 $ 46.94 $38.33 40.77] $ 45.53
RAISINS / BULK 10#/CS 57090 $ 18.00 $25.04 19.13] $ 55.42
RELISH / SWEET PICKLE 4/GAL/ICS 57100 $ 21.95 $24.39 21.73] $ 25.20




55316 RICE / BROWN 25#/IBAG uncle bens 25 57290 $24.05] $ 29.37 $26.16 23.95] $ 15.11
SALAD OIL / CANOLA 6/960z/CS 12 57480 $ 35.81 $38.66 33.18] $ 35.24
55320 SALSA / THICK'N CHUNCKY 4/GALI/CS oregta 57560 $33.15] $ 42.84 $41.87 31.84] $ 42.22
49322 SAUCE / BBQ / OPEN PIT 4/GALI/CS fout and one 57600 $22.30] $ 45.92 $33.03 33.70] $ 26.83
SAUCE/HONEY MUSTARD 4/GALI/CS 57650 $ 54.31 $42.85 45.01] $ 41.83
SAUCE / ORANGE-GINGER 2/GAL/CS 57660 $ 40.32 $39.12 $ 29.52
SAUCE/ HOT 4/GALI/CS 57790 $ 35.73 $29.18 26.94] $ 31.14
SAUCE / SOY (Low-Sodium) 4/GAL/CS 57800 $ 39.52 $36.94 38.71] $ 38.91
55202 SAUCE / SWEET & SOUR 2/GAL/CS jtm 6/5# 57810 $44.02] $ 21.27 $15.56 15.85) $ 12.81
55203 SAUCE / TERRIYAKI / GAL (Low-Sodium) 4/GALI/CS jtm 6/5# 57840 $46.57]1 $ 44.37 38.55] $ 39.88
SAUCE / WORCESTERSHIRE 4/GALI/CS 57910 $ 27.02 $18.42 16.25) $ 18.61
SAUERKRAUT / SHREDDED 6/#10/CS 58000 $ 28.08 $25.51 25.50] $ 25.02
SHAKERS / PEPPER 48/1.5 0zICS 58060 $ 58.78 $39.00 42.62] $ 54.65
SHAKERS / SALT 48/4 0zICS 58070 $ 27.18 $14.68 13.49] $ 11.71
SHORTENING / CRISCO 12/3#ICS 58080 $ 55.88 $58.65 60.99] $ 60.97
SOUP/ CANNED / TOMATO / Campbells 12/50 0z/CS 58800 $ 33.47 $30.25 27.60] $ 30.23
SPICE / BASIL LEAVES 24 OZICTR 59050 $ 10.82 $9.22 4.61] $ 6.97
SPICE / BAY LEAVES 12 OZ/CTR 59100 $ 15.01 $9.67 15.39] $ 10.41
SPICE / CELERY SALT 32 OZ/CTR 59150 $ 6.68 $5.51 5.89] $ 4.04
SPICE / CELERY SEED 32 OZ/CTR $ 8.16 $5.22 9.20] $ 9.15
SPICE / CHILI POWDER 16 OZ/CTR 59200 $ 8.68 $5.82 6.29] $ 6.15
SPICE / CINNAMON / GRD 16 OZ/CTR 59250 $ 10.88 $5.79 5.20] $ 4.32
SPICE / CLOVES / WHOLE 11 OZ/CTR 59290 NO BID 18.37] $ 16.67
SPICE / CLOVES / GROUND 16 OZ/CTR 59300 $ 19.91 19.03] $ 20.96
SPICE / CREAM OF TARTER 29 OZ/CTR 59350 NO BID 17.80] $ 16.66
SPICE / CUMIN 16 OZ/CTR 59380 $ 9.68 $7.81 7.09] $ 3.87
SPICE / FENNEL SEED 14 OZ/CTR 59400 NO BID 11.09] $ 11.17
SPICE / GARLIC / GRANULATE 23 OZ/CTR 59450 12.47 $8.58 9.27] $ 6.14
SPICE / GARLIC POWDER 16 OZ/CTR 59500 11.33 $7.12 7728 $ 4.38
SPICE / GINGER 16 OZ/CTR 59600 $ 14.35 $7.64 14.59] $ 15.33
SPICE / LAWRY'S SEASONED SALT 16 OZ/CTR NO BID 3.98] $ 4.29
SPICE / LEMON PEPPER 28 OZ/CTR 59630 $ 11.36 $7.37 10.55) $ 15.24
SPICE / MUSTARD / DRIED 14 OZ/CTR 59650 $ 6.36 $4.59 3.51] $ 7.36
SPICE / NUTMEG 16 OZ/CTR 59700 $ 15.55 $23.90 11.24] $ 16.53
SPICE / ONION POWDER 20 OZ/CTR 59750 $ 6.91 $6.26 441] $ 6.21
SPICE / OREGANO /CUT 24 OZICTR 59850 $ 13.41 $17.54 8.39] $ 7.99
SPICE / PAPRIKA 16 OZ/CTR 59900 $ 8.36 $7.36 6.78] $ 4.16
SPICE / PARSLEY FLAKE 16 OZ/CTR 59950 $ 12.45 $8.62 12.55) $ 9.47
SPICE / PEPPER / BLACK 16 OZ/CTR 60000 $ 12.62 $8.95 7.55] $ 8.96
SPICE / PEPPER / CAYANNE 16 OZ/CTR 60010 $ 7.52 $6.01 4.62] $ 4.71
SPICE / PEPPER / RED FLAKE 12 OZ/CTR 60050 $ 6.34 $4.38 5.09] $ 5.11
SPICE / PEPPER / WHITE 16 OZ/CTR 60100 $ 21.28 $13.19 14.30] $ 9.24
SPICE / POULTRY SEASON 10 OZ/CTR 60150 $ 11.26 $6.94 8.77] $ 12.24
SPICE / ROSEMARY LEAVES 6 OZ/CTR 60170 $ 8.08 $4.17 7.13] $ 9.06




SPICE / SAGE 16 OZ/ICTR 60190 $ 9.91 $4.47 9.251 $ 16.20
SPICE / SALT / 24/26 24/26 0zI/CS 60200 $ 11.70 $10.00 13.65] $ 11.62
SPICE / KOSHER SALT 12/3#/CS 60210 $ 16.87 $22.63 25.32] $ 20.62
SPICE / SESAME SEED 16 OZ/ICTR 60260 $ 5.94 $4.87 6.66] $ 4.38
SPICE / THYME 33 0Z/ICTR 60300 $ 10.61 $19.52 10.76] $ 8.51
BASE / BEEF (low sodium) 6/1#/CS 60350 $ 36.98 $40.53 55.20] $ 29.78
BASE / CHICKEN (low sodium) 12/1#ICS 60360 $ 30.24 $39.12 25.201 $ 25.64
STUFFING / OVEN / CHICKEN - WGR 6/3.5#/CS 60400 $ 67.83 $ 52.81
SUGAR / LIGHT BROWN 24/1#ICS 60500 $ 24.61 $23.26 23.99]1 $ 26.27
SUGAR / CONFECTIONER 24/1#ICS 60550 $ 24.60 $23.26 23.99] $ 26.27
SUGAR / GRANULATED 50#/BG 60600 $ 29.19 $37.45 26.78] $ 26.15
47006 TACO SHELLS / REGULAR 8/25/CS 60800 $11.00] $ 12.39 10.68] $ 10.51
TEA / HERBAL 6/28 PKT/CS 60880 $ 16.91 $15.74 16.54] $ 20.10
TEA BAGS / LIPTON 10/100 PKT/CS 60900 $ 39.82 $36.18 38.06] $ 41.00
TEA BAGS / DECAF LIPTON 6/72 PKT/CS 60910 $ 32.48 $29.91 30.49]1 $ 34.31
TOMATO PASTE / FANCY 6/#10/CS 61000 $ 33.42 $32.00 29.32] $ 32.72
TOMATO PUREE 6/#10/CS 61010 $ 22.36 $21.33 21.48] $ 22.93
TOMATO / SAUCE 6/#10/CS 61020 $ 22.77 $17.37 18.83] $ 19.49
TOMATOES / CRUSHED 6/#10/CS 61050 $ 22.36 $18.69 18.55] $ 22.02
TOMATOES / WHOLE 6/#10/CS 61100 $ 23.20 $21.51 18.20] $ 19.74
TOPPING / STRAWBERRY 3/#10/CS 61110 $ 45.94 $49.29 39.05] $ 51.88
TOPPING / HERS. CHOC SYRP 6/#10/CS 61130 $ 45.53 $45.28 46.20] $ 45.90
55422 TUNA/LGHT IN WATER 6/66.5 0z/CS chicken of the sea also aval in pouch 40 61200 $56.10 NO BID $66.95 55.90] $ 49.84
VINEGAR / CIDER 4/GAL/CS 61300 NO BID $9.68 7.950 $ 15.00
VINEGAR / RED WINE 4/GAL/CS 61350 NO BID $9.16 7.951 $ 10.60
VINEGAR / WHITE 4/GAL/CS 61400 NO BID $6.26 6.95| $ 8.65
WALNUTS / CHOPPED 6/4#/CS 61550 NO BID $151.76 187.42] $ 33.53
WINE / MARSALA / COOKING GAL or QTS $ 23.49 $20.32 13.43] $ 6.77
SNACKS
CRACKERS/ CARRS / ASST 1 CASE 75150 $ 49.07 $46.44 28.50] $ 50.14
2105 CRACKERS/ GRAHAM 150/3PK/CS 12 75180 $16.80] $ 33.53 $15.86 19.45] $ 15.70
CRACKERS / SALTINES / WW 500/2 PK/CS 75200 $ 17.91 $10.20 10.70] $ 12.76
2096 CRACKERS / CHOC BEAR / MJM Marketing 300/2PK/CS 25 75220 $38.50 NO BID $36.32 36.98
2092 CRACKERS / VANILLA BEAR / MJM Marketing 300/2PK/CS 25 75240 $38.50 NO BID $36.32 36.98
MISC
ENCOMPASS DEGREASER 4/GAL/CS 90170 $ 25.27 $15.43 76.25] $ 30.64
LAUNDRY DETERGENT 1/5 GAL/CS 90240 $ 90.26 $67.02 118.75] $ 63.31
DISTILLED WATER 4/GAL/ICS NO BID $9.84 8.98] $ 7.36

GLUTEN FREE




TORTILLA - BROWN RICE- Food For Life 6 per pack - (57g each) NO BID $ 36.89
ROLL - HAMBURGER- Against the Grain (Original) 4 per pack UPC: 892453001013 $ 23.59 $21.85 $ 54.86
ROLL - HOT DOG BUN NO BID $19.00 20.20 $ 24.57

18039 PASTA - BARILLA GLUTEN FREE - Variety 1# Boxes $23.60] $ 23.32 $21.22 22.56] $ 21.00
additional items

7102 bagel wh grain 2.3 oz brookin 75/2.3 oz $13.00

47008 smokewood taco boat 200/cs $49.50

4015 regular 3.5 pretzel j&J 100/3.5 $17.95

55259-5526 fruit and veg juice 70/4 oz equal vegetable $11.97

55398 16" wg proof pizza crust schwans 18/16" $32.40

36005 turkey bacon perdue 2/6# $38.15

TBD butterball turkey sausage links butterball 10# $23.40

51078 vegelene spray $22.50

51079 allergen free pan spray $25.53













